PAGE: 1

DATE: 09/21/12

CONTRACT IR-32130-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900273 DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 6,430,000.00

CALL: 120 ROUTE: 31 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM 96TH STREET TO 203RD STREET

COUNTY: HAMILTON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 3,913,000.00	R X 	AWARD
35-1151771	CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC	WHITESTOWN Indiana	317-769-1900	\$ 4,441,000.00	R	
35-1698047	GRADEX INC 	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-573-3970	\$ 4,360,676.44	R	
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC 	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-4452	\$ 3,967,110.40	R	

PAGE: 2A

DATE: 08/31/12

CONTRACT IR-33741-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500450 DBE GOAL: 9.00

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 69,031,900.00

CALL: 130 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM HARMONY ROAD TO BRANCH OF CLEAR CREEK

COUNTY: MONROE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 2,002,045.25 			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION			\$ 1,428,728.81 			
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CROWN POINT	219-661-2450	\$ 51,802,034.49 	R		
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	CROWN POINT	219-661-2450	NO BID	R	 	
27-0887958	WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY II LLC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	CROWN POINT IN	219-661-2450	\$ 7,662,421.14 	R		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 51,169,229.24 	R		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	NO BID	R 		
32-0289822	KOLB GRADING LLC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	ST CHARLES MO	636-441-0200	\$ 7,544,931.47 	R 		
34-0907180	E S WAGNER COMPANY SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	OREGON OH	419-691-8651	\$ 49,584,490.24 	R 	X	AWARD DBE 9.10%
34-0907180	E S WAGNER COMPANY SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	OREGON OH	419-691-8651	NO BID	R 		
34-0907180	E S WAGNER COMPANY SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	OREGON OH	419-691-8651	\$ 7,995,758.35 	R 	X	
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	\$ 68,283,467.94 	R 		
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	NO BID	R 		

CONTRACT IR-33741-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500450 DBE GOAL: 9.00

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 69,031,900.00

CALL: 130 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM HARMONY ROAD TO BRANCH OF CLEAR CREEK

COUNTY: MONROE

CODE	COUNTY: MONROE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE L	OW REMARKS
34-4456871	MILLER BROS CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	ARCHBOLD OH	419-445-1015	\$ 7,714,633.57 	R 	
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 59,538,166.37 	R 	
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	NO BID	R 	
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	BLOOMINGTON IN	812-336-4452	\$ 7,918,227.15 	R	
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	\$ 65,269,746.10 	R 	
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	NO BID	R	
35-2040801	GOHMANN CONSTRUCTION INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	CLARKSVILLE IN	812-282-1349	\$ 9,222,863.35 	R	
43-0626545	FRED WEBER INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	MARYLAND HTS	314-344-0070	\$ 60,928,844.63 	R	
43-0626545	FRED WEBER INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	MARYLAND HTS	314-344-0070	NO BID	R	
43-0626545	FRED WEBER INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	MARYLAND HTS	314-344-0070	\$ 8,348,679.80 	R	

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002; OR

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003..

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0003 + PVFM 0003

= \$49,584,490.24 + \$7,995,758.35 + \$1,344,466.38 = \$59,008,977.40

LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = \$57,580,248.59

PAGE: 2B DATE: 08/31/12

PAGE: 3

DATE: 08/28/12

CONTRACT IR-34268-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005456 DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,297,300.00 CALL: 140 ROUTE: 69 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON PR 69 AT THE INTERSECTION OF CR 250N AND SR 43, 1.4 MILES MODTH OF CD EA AND 2 E MILEC WEST OF CD AE

CODE	COUNTY: GREENE BIDDER	MONROE ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUI	NT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
20-1237324	KERNS EXCAVATING LLC	BICKNELL Indiana	812-291-5156	\$ 1,40 	51,769.00	R 		
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 1,48 	82,984.50	R 		
35-1801998	CLR INC 	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$ 1,24	44,355.45	R 	х	AWARD DBE 6.00%
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-4452	\$ 1,68 	86,735.90	R 		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 1,98	33,387.00	R		

PAGE: 4

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -28899-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 8914305 DBE GOAL: 8.00

DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,341,000.00

CALL: 180 ROUTE: US 6 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT LOCATION: ON US 6 OVER BLUE DITCH, 0.6 MILE EAST IF SR 13/ US 33 WEST

JUNTION

COUNTY: ELKHART AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS CODE BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE 32-0154474 | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC LAPORTE | \$ 1,840,465.71 |R Indiana 219-324-9393 35-0918397 | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION GOSHEN | \$ 1,577,000.00 |R Indiana 574-875-5183 35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC MILFORD | \$ 1,791,121.03 |R Indiana 574-658-4166 | \$ 1,482,126.12 |R | 35-1690004 | NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION | MISHAWAKA 574-256-1811 Indiana 35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC | \$ 1,405,600.67 |R | X | ALBION AWARD * Indiana 260-636-3000 DBE 8.20%

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(B) - LOW BIDDER IS ONE OF FOUR OR MORE BIDS RECEIVED.

PAGE: 5

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -30118-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200073 DBE GOAL: 6.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 308,000.00

CALL: 190 ROUTE: 24 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 24 OVER TRIBUTARY TO GUSHWA DITCH

COUNTY: JASPER

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	Ī	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-3919039	TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL	MICHIGAN CITY Indiana	219-879-7321	\$ 	357,288.51	R 		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 	299,417.00	R 	X	AWARD DBE 6.01%
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-887-5233	\$ 	383,400.00	R 		
35-1325036	DEICHMAN EXCAVATING CO	LOGANSPORT Indiana	574-722-7677	\$ 	326,115.99	R 		
35-1386990	JACK ISOM CONSTRUCTION CO	REYNOLDS Indiana	219-984-5765	\$ 	360,297.51	R 		
35-1523985	YATES CONSTRUCTION INC	KENTLAND Indiana	219-474-6542	\$ 	311,756.15	R 		
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$ 	301,001.76	R 		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 	329,868.92	R 		
35-2094565	3D COMPANY INC	MUNCIE Indiana	765-288-3326	\$ 	323,900.00	R 		

PAGE: 6A

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -32767-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800230 DBE GOAL: 8.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 4,840,000.00 *

CALL: 196 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SOUTH ADAMS STREET FROM CR 200S TO SR 124

COUNTY:	WELLS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 	573,930.29			
	PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE			\$ 	382,324.07			
20-0186850	VTF EXCAVATION LLC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	CELINA OH	419-586-3077	\$ 	2,687,513.38	R 		
20-0186850	VTF EXCAVATION LLC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	CELINA OH	419-586-3077	\$ 	2,278,593.33	R 		
20-0186850	VTF EXCAVATION LLC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	CELINA OH	419-586-3077	\$ 	2,559,228.36	R 		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 	3,266,645.59	R 		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 	2,094,264.72	R 		
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	MILFORD IN	574-658-4166	\$ 	2,594,394.33			
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990	\$ 	2,560,355.88		X	AWARD DBE 8.01%
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990	\$ 	1,910,882.12		X	
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1990		NO BID			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	\$ 	2,424,526.02			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	\$	2,049,886.42			

CONTRACT R -32767-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0800230 DBE GOAL: 8.00

DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 4,840,000.00 *

CALL: 196 ROUTE: FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SOUTH ADAMS STREET FROM CR 200S TO SR 124

CODE	COUNTY: WELLS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	ANDERSON IN	765-643-5358	\$ 2,427,595.45 		
35-1267175	FLEMING EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	DECATUR	260-724-2697	\$ 2,849,441.74 		
35-1267175	FLEMING EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	DECATUR	260-724-2697	\$ 1,773,956.37 		
35-1267175	FLEMING EXCAVATING INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	DECATUR	260-724-2697	NO BID		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0001 COMMON ITEMS	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 2,597,634.46 		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0002 HMA OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	NO BID		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	FORT WAYNE IN	260-478-1548	\$ 2 ,284,996.94 		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-334-0758	\$ 2,967,243.28 		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-334-0758	\$ 2,086,274.72 		
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC SECTION 0003 PCCP OPTION	INDIANAPOLIS IN	317-334-0758	\$ 2,482,331.03		

NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE:

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0002; OR

SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0003..

THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0001 + SECTION 0002 + PVFM 0002

= \$ 2,560,355.88 + \$1,910,882.12 + \$ 573,930.29 38 = \$ 5,045,168.29

LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = \$ 4,471,238.00

PAGE: 6B

DATE: 08/16/12

^{*} ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE ERRANTLY READ AS "NONE BELOW" AT LETTING.

PAGE: 7

DATE: 08/28/12

CONTRACT R -33241-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902235 DBE GOAL: 7.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 435,000.00

CALL: 200 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON MAIN STREET FROM MADISON TO WASHINGTON STREET

COUNTY: MARSHALL

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AN	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS	
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$	455,637.81	R 	X	AWARD *	
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC 	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$	588,327.85	R 			
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$	467,282.10	R 			
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$	490,357.55	R 			

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 8

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -33367-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900060 DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 177,000.00

CALL: 210 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT LOCATION: ALONG LITTLE CALUMET RIVER FROM INDIANAPOLIS BOULEVARDE

WEST TO NORTHCOTE AVENUE

COUNTY: LAKE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AM	OUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$	286,706.21	R 		
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-887-5233	\$	259,700.00	R 		
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC 	GRIFFITH Indiana	219-924-5900	\$	245,865.74	R 	X	AWARD *
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$	298,991.00	R 		

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED FOR THE LETTING OF August 08, 2012

DATE: 08/28/12

CONTRACT R -33814-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810329 DBE GOAL: 10.00

DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITY ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW ROUTE:

CALL: 220 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT MORSE RESERVOIR AT WALKWAY OVER JACKSON STREET

CODE	COUNTY: HAMILTON BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS	
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 4,184,400.00 R REJECTED *	
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 3,163,565.73 R REJECTED *	
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 3,797,000.00 R REJECTED *	
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 4,495,866.63 R REJECTED *	

^{*}NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - ALL BIDS REJECTED, TO BE RESCOPED AND READVERTISED AT A LATER DATE.

PAGE: 10

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -34530-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901888 DBE GOAL: 0.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 578,000.00 DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING

CALL: 240 VINCENNES DISTRICT ROUTE: LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT VINCENNES DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS	
35-1004746	TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P	SALEM Indiana	812-883-6644	\$	398,800.00	R 	X	AWARD	
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$	436,465.50	R 			
35-2097364	INDIANA RELINE INC 	SULPHUR SPRINGS Indiana	765-533-5040	\$	496,803.00	 R 	 		

PAGE: 11

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -34616-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173774 MBE GOAL: 7.00 WBE GOAL: 5.00

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 281,000.00

CALL: 250 ROUTE: IR 1001 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 75S FROM SR 9 TO CHAIN O' LAKES GATEHOUSE

COUNTY: NOBLE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	\$ \$ 574-658-4166	279,382.36	R 	
35-1065659	BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1990	249,019.36	R 	
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	278,687.48	R 	
35-1185040	NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC	BRISTOL Indiana	574-848-4437	286,660.56	R	
62-1492793	API CONSTRUCTION CORP	LAOTTO Indiana	\$ 260-897-2743	236,705.48	R X 	AWARD MBE 7.03% WBE 5.05%

PAGE: 12

DATE: 08/28/12

CONTRACT R -34641-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173546 DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: DEMOLITION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 226,000.00

CALL: 260 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON 45TH AVENUE FROM WHITCOMB STREET TO GRANT STREET

COUNTY: LAKE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-887-5233	\$ 	253,900.00	R 		
35-1339168	LAPORTE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY I	LAPORTE Indiana	219-393-5555	\$ 	763,265.87	R 		
35-1569222	GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC	HIGHLAND Indiana	219-924-1623	\$ 	218,571.60	R 	X	AWARD
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 	232,329.00	R	 	

PAGE: 13

DBE GOAL: 6.00

DATE: 08/31/12

CONTRACT R -35065-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297098

DESCRIPTION: REST AREA AND PARKING AREA CONSTRUCTION/RECONSTRUCT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 3,677,000.00

CALL: 270 ROUTE: I-70 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT I-70 EASTBOUND GREENFIELD REST AREA

COUNTY: HANCOCK

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 3,292,000.00 R
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC 	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 3,232,597.60 R X AWARD * DBE 3.01% **
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 3,585,000.00 R

^{*}AWARD BASED ON GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.

^{**} CORRECTED DBE PARTICIPATION TO MATCH OUTCOME DOCUMENTATION OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY DIVISION'S GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW. (10-02-12)

PAGE: 14 DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT R -35162-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297422 DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: CENTERLINE AND EDGE LINE RUMBLE STRIPES INSTALLATIO ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 201,000.00

CALL: 280 ROUTE: 231 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 231 FROM 0.54 MILE NORTH OF I-74 TO 5.48 MILES NORTH OF SR 28

COUNTY: MONTGOMERY TIPPECANOE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	Al	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
25-1584843	SURFACE PREPARATION TECHNOLOGI	MECHANICSBURG Pennsylvania	717-697-1450	\$ 	403,098.00	R	IRREGULAR *
35-2040834	GRIDLOCK TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-541-2727	\$ 	478,750.24	R X	AWARD **

^{*}FAILED TO SUBMIT A PERFORMANCE BOND AND POWER OF ATTORNEY LETTER WITH THE BID. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(1).

^{**}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 15

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT RS-32684-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901493, 0710363 DBE GOAL: 5.00

DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 682,000.00

CALL: 300 ROUTE: 526 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 526 FROM 765 FEET NORTH OF PURDUE AIRPORT TO SR 126 AND ON SR 126 FROM SR 526 TO US 231

COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 	615,709.00	R 	X	AWARD DBE 5.00%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 	719,250.21	R 		

FOR THE LETTING OF August 08, 2012

MBE GOAL: 7.00

CONTRACT RS-34892-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297235 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE

WBE GOAL: 5.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 410,000.00

PAGE: 16

DATE: 08/23/12

CALL: 310 ROUTE: VARIOUS

FT. WAYNE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT MISSISSINEWA LAKE AND ISP PERU POST

COUNTY: MIAMI

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$ 439,715.92	R X	AWARD * MBE 7.45% WBE 5.32%
35-1139301	E & B PAVING INC	ANDERSON Indiana	765-643-5358	\$ 493,084.89	R	
35-1505753	GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC	WABASH Indiana	260-563-1821	\$ 618,341.45	R	
35-1621699	CENTRAL PAVING INC 	LOGANSPORT Indiana	574-722-4727	\$ 523,618.46	R	

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 17

DATE: 08/16/12

CONTRACT B -32638-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810168 DBE GOAL: 0.00

DESCRIPTION: SCOUR PROTECTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 231,000.00

CALL: 370 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS BRIDGES THROUGHOUT CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AM	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$	287,605.00	R 		
35-1801998	CLR INC 	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$	225,558.00	R 	X	AWARD
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$	254,597.40	R 		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE 	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$	287,155.00	R 		

PAGE: 18

DATE: 08/28/12

CONTRACT B -33816-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9999312 DBE GOAL: 8.00

DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 609,000.00

CALL: 380 ROUTE: CR 850W GREENFIELD DISTRICT LOCATION: ON CR 850W OVER DEER CREEK

COUNTY: HENRY

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	ž	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	WEST CHESTER Ohio	513-326-6000	\$ 	636,467.45	R 		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 	553,443.65	R 	X	AWARD dbe 8.71%
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 	692,928.95	R 		
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC 	ALBION Indiana	260-636-3000	\$ 	630,680.90	R 		
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-579-5248	\$ 	624,900.00	R 		
61-1358884	HALL CONTRACTING OF KENTUCKY I	LOUISVILLE Kentucky	502-992-3732	\$ 	770,611.05	R 		

PAGE: 19 DATE: 09/11/12

FOR THE LETTING OF August 08, 2012

CONTRACT M -32975-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901959 MBE GOAL: 7.00 WBE GOAL: 5.00

DESCRIPTION: GUARDRAIL REPAIR AND MAINTENANCE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 173,000.00

CALL: 400 ROUTE: LAPORTE DISTRICT LOCATION: VARIOUS ROADS THROUGHOUT THE LAPORTE DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS	
35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-876-3739	\$ 	217,020.00	R 	X	AWARD * MBE 0.00%	WBE 5.09%
35-2110733	SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC AND SU	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-594-0291	\$ 	249,304.00	R 			

^{*}AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

FOR THE LETTING OF August 08, 2012

MBE GOAL: 7.00

PAGE: 20

DATE: 10/09/12

CONTRACT M -34513-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1173533 WBE GOAL: 5.00
DESCRIPTION: MAINTENANCE TREE REMOVAL ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 410 ROUTE: VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT THE VINCENNES DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AN	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-4574	\$ 	146,855.00	R 	REJECTED *
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 	187,105.00	R	REJECTED *
61-1103168	SWARTZ MOWING INC 	OLYMPIA Kentucky	606-674-2971	\$ 	128,805.00	R	REJECTED *

^{*}NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - ALL BIDS REJECTED, TO BE READVERTISED FOR THE 11-15-12 INDOT HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS LETTING.

PAGE: 21

DATE: 09/11/12

FOR THE LETTING OF August 08, 2012

CONTRACT M -34812-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1297204 MBE GOAL: 7.00 WBE GOAL: 5.00

DESCRIPTION: ROADSIDE MAINTENANCE, MOWING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 135,000.00

CALL: 420 ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS WITHIN THE VINCENNES DISTRICT

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-1606893	OLCO INC	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-4574	\$ 86,510.00	R	
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 67,330.00	R X	AWARD * MBE 0.00% WBE 0.00%
35-2045735	J & M CONTRACTING INC	SHELBYVILLE Indiana	317-979-7805	\$ 94,809.00	R	

^{*}AWARD BASED ON MINORITY AND WOMEN'S BUSINESS ENTERPRISES DIVISION, INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION, GOOD FAITH EFFORTS REVIEW.